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Abstract
Public engagement in health technologies continuously expands thanks to increased recognition and financial 
support. Yet, the lack of a shared definition and standards enables practitioners to conduct initiatives 
in ways that prioritise their self-interests over the empowerment of citizens. Experts and policymakers 
generally design engagement initiatives following rigid protocols to fit their agenda, limiting the influence of 
citizens upstream. In reaction to this and as an attempt to disambiguate public engagement from an ethical 
perspective, we investigate its intrinsic value. Starting from the assumption that public engagement must 
primarily empower citizens and not those who already have enough power to make their voices heard, we 
argue that the more the engagement process puts citizens at the centre, the more the engagement practice 
becomes valuable regardless of the methods used. To make the citizen-centred approach a reality, we 
suggest ethical principles that practitioners could apply across the spectrum of engagement.
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1. Introduction

Public engagement on the ethical, legal and societal issues (ELSI) of health technologies is an ever-
expanding field (Burall, 2018; Pezzullo et al., 2021). Health technologies, such as genomic 
sequencing and editing, artificial intelligence and robotics, offer unprecedented opportunities to 
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improve individuals’ and populations’ health. They also challenge existing ethical, legal and soci-
etal frameworks, impacting citizens collectively and individually (Margaux et al., 2022; Wirz 
et al., 2020). It is increasingly recognised that citizens should participate in the ELSI discussions 
of health technologies, as illustrated by the EU4Health programme, which consistently requires 
involving stakeholders, patients and citizens in project proposals (European Commission, n.d.). 
Arguments justifying the engagement’s necessity are normative (considering people potentially 
impacted ensure that policy decisions align with their values and interests), epistemic (lay experi-
ences and perspectives should feed controversial issues) and strategic (gaining trust and accept-
ance) (Das et al., 2022; Margaux et al., 2022; Middleton et al., 2022, 2023; Pezzullo et al., 2021; 
Wirz et al., 2020).

A myriad of methods has been used to engage citizens, from surveys and interviews to delib-
erative fora and juries, to mention a few. These methods serve different purposes in diverse 
contexts, for instance, education and sensitisation about science, feedback on research projects 
and co-creation in policy decision-making. On an indicative basis, the continuously updated but 
non-exhaustive platform Participedia catalogues 368 engagement methods on any topic in 159 
countries (Participedia, n.d.).

The organic development of public engagement has resulted in a heterogeneous practice with 
no shared definition and standards (Abelson et al., 2013; Baumann et al., 2022; Bell et al., 2018; 
Boon et al., 2022; Das et al., 2022; Degeling et al., 2015; Engage2020, 2015; Kreeftenberg et al., 
2024; Middleton et al., 2023; Pezzullo et al., 2021; Pytlik Zillig and Tomkins, 2011; Ryan and 
Smith, 2014; Samuel and Farsides, 2018; Woolley et al., 2016). In 2002, Litva et al. had already 
raised the issue of having a blurred conceptual understanding of public engagement, whereas 
health authorities increasingly used it in multiple contexts. Over two decades later, it seems this 
problem is still unsolved. The variety of specific definitions in the literature, ranging from expert-
driven communication to high degrees of co-creation, is confusing (Bell et al., 2018; Boon et al., 
2022; Council of Europe, 2019; Das et al., 2022; Degeling et al., 2015; Meagher and Lee, 2016; 
Nature, 2004; Pezzullo et al., 2021; Reed et al., 2024; Ryan and Smith, 2014; Samuel and Farsides, 
2018; Saunders, 2018; Sciencewize, 2019; UCL Public Engagement Unit, 2022). The lack of 
homogeneity is also apparent in quality standards: the only well-described ones are specific to 
some methods (surveys, focus groups, deliberative processes), omitting the holistic perspective 
on public engagement. There have been few attempts to grasp the chaos of engagement practices, 
from guidelines measuring the effectiveness of activities to decision-tree tools and continuums 
ranking methods according to deliberative, democratic and participatory aspects or outputs’ effec-
tiveness (Baumann et al., 2022; Bell et al., 2018; Das et al., 2022; Pytlik Zillig and Tomkins, 
2011; Ryan and Smith, 2014; Saunders, 2018; UCD, n.d.; UCL Public Engagement Unit, 2022). 
These provide helpful overviews, guiding practitioners to select the most appropriate methods 
depending on their needs. Similarly, Murtagh et al. (2021) developed an Engagement Framework 
to support practitioners to produce fair outcomes and ensure diversity, equality and inclusivity in 
participation.

Yet, further reflection is needed to investigate the fundamental meaning of public engagement 
from a normative perspective. By exploring a new normative approach to engagement and related 
ethical principles, this article provides a starting point for stakeholders and practitioners to discuss 
the intrinsic value of public engagement and evaluate its qualities accordingly. This questioning is 
crucial because, without a normative common ground on the essence of public engagement, some 
practitioners and stakeholders tend to use initiatives in ways that prioritise their self-interests over 
the empowerment of citizens – leading to abuses (Stilgoe et al., 2014; Wynne, 2006). In particular, 
we focus on public engagement about the ELSI of health technologies organised in the context of 
projects shaping policymaking or scientific agendas. Nevertheless, the present reflection is still 
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pertinent and valuable for public engagement in general, whatever the topic. Finally, this article 
focuses on the general population as the targeted public in engagement initiatives despite the exist-
ence of various sub-groups. The concept of citizens is voluntarily kept as broad as possible given 
the transversal and holistic approach to public engagement this article attempts to build.

2. Misleading practices

In the past, interactions with the lay public were often strategically used as one-way communica-
tion from the experts to ‘ignorant’ citizens to enhance their literacy and trust in science, an early 
movement known as ‘public understanding of science’ (Hu, 2024; Wynne, 2006). Although now 
this deficit model is criticised as old-fashioned, it sometimes persists in the mindset of policymak-
ers, experts and practitioners (Boon et al., 2022; Das et al., 2022; Fox and Martschenko, 2023; 
Middleton et al., 2023; Ryll, 2023; Samuel and Farsides, 2018; Saunders, 2018; Woolley et al., 
2016). In 2020, a survey asking 6242 scientists from 46 universities about the purpose of public 
engagement indicated that education (95.1%), improving trust (88.3%) and excitement about sci-
ence (82.6%) were the most supported answers (Rose et al., 2020). These results are unsurprising 
since citizens’ trust and support are foundational to successful uses of health technologies (Adjekum 
et al., 2017; Hu, 2024). Within grant proposals, funders of engagement activities regularly demand 
that projects assess the acceptability of new technologies by the public. Framing the engagement 
in terms of acceptability narrows the scope of the discussions and frames lay expectations towards 
acceptance. Even in well-known, well-designed projects, practitioners may unconsciously orient 
the process to serve self-interests, showing how hard it is to conduct non-biased engagement when 
the power solely lies in the hands of the organisers. Semi-structured interviews of 20 individuals 
associated with Genomics England in their engagement activity about the 100,000 Genomes 
Project pinpointed the blurred boundaries between its two conflicting goals. Gaining acceptance 
from the public was so vital to the project’s success (recruiting enough participants to collect 
100,000 genomes) that it sometimes resulted in overselling its benefits and prevailed on the inten-
tion of creating an honest dialogue with participants about their concerns (Samuel and Farsides, 
2018). In worse cases, engagement initiatives are used as a performative facade without commit-
ment to empowering citizens (Boon et al., 2022; Degeling et al., 2015; Dryzek et al., 2020; Stilgoe 
et al., 2014; Woolley et al., 2016; World Health Organization, 2022; Wynne, 2006). Blacker et al. 
(2021) have denounced this phenomenon under the term public relations. They illustrated it through 
several projects where organisers, whether industries, scientists or non-profit organisations, manip-
ulated participants’ views in favour of polluting industries or oriented the results to attenuate claims 
about harms and risks.

Generally speaking, engagement initiatives are predominantly designed to follow rigid and 
strictly controlled protocols defined in advance to fit experts and policymakers’ agendas, limiting 
the influence of citizens and leaving little room for active collaboration with them (Brandsen et al., 
2018; Wirz et al., 2020). A longitudinal empirical study of public engagements on genome editing 
has recently demonstrated that regardless of the methods used, from expert-driven models to delib-
erative dialogues with local communities, nearly all initiatives end up limiting the role and influence 
of citizens in the engagement process and the governance of health technologies while claiming to 
empower citizens (Conley et al., 2023). The authors identified limitations in participants selection 
(civil society representatives or experts instead of laypeople), the education delivered (not neutral, 
orienting participants’ views), equal chances to express opinions (dominance in group discussions) 
and the absence of influence of outcomes on policies. They pointed out the limited added value of 
most engagement initiatives that mainly repeat the discourse of dominant voices, perpetuating 
power imbalances from society into the engagement activity (Conley et al., 2023). One explanation 
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lies in practitioners’ natural tendency to focus on participants agreeing with them as an easy way to 
achieve results, an empirical observation Agger and Larsen (2009) called discursive exclusion. That 
is in line with another empirical observation: institutional-led initiatives are more likely to be con-
sidered in their outcomes, although they tend to miss public concerns revealed by more citizen-
driven engagements (Saunders, 2018). Reluctance to grant citizens an active role in the governance 
of health technologies, even on ethical and societal aspects where lay voices are arguably as legiti-
mate as experts, might be explained by a lack of training in lay communication about science, scep-
ticism about the engagement leading to real impacts and the fear that laypeople could hinder 
scientific progress (Bell et al., 2018; Das et al., 2022).

These misleading practices generate misunderstandings of citizens’ perspectives, abuse their 
time, trust, and voluntariness and weaken the legitimacy of public engagement (Brandsen et al., 
2018; Pytlik Zillig and Tomkins, 2011; World Health Organization, 2024). In addition, they might 
cause disillusion and frustration among the public and damage their motivation to contribute to 
health technologies, creating the opposite effect to that pursued by public engagement (Council of 
Europe, 2019). Finally, the malleability of what practitioners can do with engagement activities 
without shared ethical commitments exposes young practitioners to feeling lost and making mis-
takes, even when driven by the best intentions.

3. The normative approach: Valuable public engagement means 
citizen-centred

When examining public engagement’s multiplicity of definitions in the literature, we identified 
recurrent concepts enabling us to formulate a generic understanding of the term. Public engage-
ment covers any activity organised by powerful actors with expertise (scientists, researchers, poli-
cymakers) that engage laypeople on topics impacting them to produce mutually beneficial 
outcomes (Boon et al., 2022; Council of Europe, 2019; Das et al., 2022; Nature, 2004; Pezzullo 
et al., 2021; Reed et al., 2024; Ryan and Smith, 2014; Saunders, 2018; Sciencewize, 2019; World 
Health Organization, 2022). The process aims to build on divergent but complementary knowl-
edge, experience and interests towards a common goal (Bell et al., 2018; Fox and Martschenko, 
2023; Meagher and Lee, 2016; UCL Public Engagement Unit, 2022). Underlying concepts are 
participation, empowerment, partnership, mutual learning and understanding, equity, democracy, 
trust, impact, respect for diversity and inclusivity (Baumann et al., 2022; Brandsen et al., 2018; 
Degeling et al., 2015; Kamenova, 2023; Middleton et al., 2023; Murtagh et al., 2021).

Based on that umbrella definition and in reaction to engagement practices deviating from it, we 
investigate the fundamental value of public engagement. If – as it is often nobly defended – the 
primary societal function of public engagement is to improve fairness, trust and democracy, one 
should explore how far engagement initiatives embody the concept of power-sharing (Fox and 
Martschenko, 2023). Our thesis is that the more the engagement process puts citizens at the centre, 
the more it becomes intrinsically valuable. The citizen-centred approach can be defined as citizens’ 
empowerment by focusing on their perspectives (values, concerns, needs and experience) and con-
sidering them as equal partners, as far as feasible, in the engagement process. It intends to prioritise 
those who need to be empowered instead of reinforcing the power of those who already frame the 
implementation, use, benefits, risks and issues of health technologies. That is especially important 
as engagement activities might be the only opportunity for citizens to add their unique contribu-
tions and have a say about technologies impacting their lives (Murtagh et al., 2021). Empirical 
studies underlined that norms, values, opinions and questions raised by laypeople about the ethics 
of technologies may differ highly from those of experts and policymakers because of distinct lived 
experiences and situations (Litva et al., 2002; Mayeur et al., 2023; Tansey and Burgess, 2006; 
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Wynne, 1992). Contrary to the elitist distinction between lay and expert knowledge, one should 
consider citizens as experts of their history and perspectives within the context of public engage-
ment, complementing the understanding and views of powerful actors (Fox and Martschenko, 
2023; Litva et al., 2002; Werner, 2020; World Health Organization, 2022). The fundamental reason 
citizens should be at the centre of the process is self-evident: it is about citizen engagement.

4. Translating citizen-centred engagement into ethical principles

The ethical principles developed in this section follow a procedural logic where trust, transparency 
and empowerment are linked intimately from the early start of the engagement (Trust and trans-
parency in expectations), during the engagement (Flexibility in the process) and after the engage-
ment (Respect for outcomes).

Trust and transparency in expectations

Public engagement operates at its core on trust between unfamiliar parties with diverse interests 
and visions, sometimes conflicting, but who agree to commit their efforts to a common goal. 
Engagement would not be possible without a minimum level of trust, which is then at stake 
throughout the process (Adjekum et al., 2017; Kreeftenberg et al., 2024; Murtagh et al., 2021). If 
using the metaphor of a tree to describe the engagement process, trust is simultaneously its seed 
(minimal condition), roots (for a sustainable relationship), sap (feeding the process continuously) 
and buds ready to bloom (improved trust results from a trustworthy process generating mutually 
beneficial outcomes).

In reaction to the deficit model that uses engagement strategically to gain trust from citizens, 
Wynne (2006) argued that the deliberate search for trust is incompatible with building a trustwor-
thy relationship because one party tries to manipulate the other. Giving trust implies vulnerability 
due to the risk of being harmed or disappointed (Adjekum et al., 2017). Especially in engagement 
settings where the power of decision-making first lies in the hands of organisers, it is all the more 
important not to abuse citizens’ vulnerable position and be careful with their trust. Empirical stud-
ies have demonstrated that transparency, honesty, fairness, prioritising the public interest, equity, 
respect, openness and active participation strengthen citizens’ trust in institutions more sustainably 
(Adjekum et al., 2017; Brandsen et al., 2018). A recent literature review highlighted that the gen-
eral public establishes a close link between trust and transparency to reach social acceptability: 
when transparently informed through continuous and relevant communication, people feel consid-
ered, empowered and valued (Bilodeau et al., 2024). In parallel, the authors identified a coexisting 
link between mistrust and lack of transparency because people intuitively associated it with hiding 
something suspicious (Bilodeau et al., 2024). Transparency gives people the power to evaluate 
whether placing their trust is appropriate and reasonable. Trust must be earned, and transparency is 
the basis for rational judgement about trustworthiness.

In engagement settings, organisers can empower participants by transparently explaining who 
will have an influence on what and why to achieve expected outcomes and, ideally, let participants 
negotiate power structures at stake (Adjekum et al., 2017; Bell et al., 2018; Council of Europe, 
2019; Murtagh et al., 2021; UCL Public Engagement Unit, 2022). In a citizen-centred approach, 
transparency enables citizens to participate in the decisions, thereby influencing the process con-
tinuously (Brandsen et al., 2018). Given the evolutive nature of collaborative processes, stakeh-
olders should regularly discuss their expectations and needs, which might change over time.  
That would avoid misplaced trust, which occurs when a lack of explicit communication about  
the roles and expectations of each stakeholder ensues in disappointment (Adjekum et al., 2017). 
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We experienced this in a European project whose engagement work package was designed to let 
citizens express their needs, values and concerns freely to inform a future legal infrastructure. 
However, while the engagement activity was ongoing, the funding body published a law proposal 
defining the priorities without considering citizens’ contributions and imposed principles conflict-
ing with lay values. If political pressure can exceptionally disrupt the engagement process, it 
should be avoided as much as possible by communicating in time with organisers to let them adapt 
the engagement process or find adequate solutions. In this case, we, as organisers, could have sent 
preliminary results of lay contributions to the funding body while drafting the law proposal. A les-
son learned is to openly and early discuss the degree of influence citizens will have on higher-level 
decision-making and the most appropriate time to integrate their contributions to political or scien-
tific agendas. Respecting each stakeholder’s contribution is fundamental to avoid the impression 
that authorities are using the engagement to tick the box, which causes mistrust.

Finally, while providing adequate transparency contributes to trust, trust does not equate to 
complete transparency. Conversely, the need for full transparency is a sign of distrust because one 
cannot rely on the other without controlling all actions. Trust means relying on the ability of others 
to act responsibly and bring their competencies to achieve a common goal. That leads us to the 
second principle, urging practitioners to remain flexible and confident towards the added value of 
citizens.

Flexibility in the process: Trust what you will learn from citizens

Citizen-centred engagement aims to maximise the potential for citizens to contribute to the topic as 
lay stakeholders. In turn, practitioners will learn more from them than expected, leading to enriching 
exchanges, open-mindedness and increased mutual understanding. If engagement activities need a 
predefined goal and vision (topic, hypothesis and questions) to ensure a well-designed framework 
for involvement (Middleton et al., 2023; Saunders, 2018; UCL Public Engagement Unit, 2022), 
organisers should remain flexible in their interaction with citizens and trust their ability to provide 
original and unexpected input.

Hence, the process should be designed to support citizen empowerment, not to nudge them 
towards what dominant actors think is right. For instance, asking narrow questions may provide 
specific answers tailored to an agenda but limits the possibility for citizens to share their perspec-
tives in an undirected way, which can significantly impair their contribution (Council of Europe, 
2019). It has been demonstrated that citizen-driven initiatives highlight concerns missed by tradi-
tional engagement because they are more open to experimental processes where citizens have the 
lead (Saunders, 2018). In line with this, Mayeur et al. (2024) encouraged practitioners in online 
engagements, whose popularity is growing, to remain open-minded towards poorly informed con-
tributions of citizens because they may be indicative of shared concerns that, although scientifi-
cally incorrect, are still ethically legitimate (e.g. genetic determinism). While educating participants 
is essential to guarantee relevant contributions, engagement must not be reduced to education at the 
risk of neglecting the voices of many citizens who will remain poorly educated about health tech-
nologies, given their complexity.

In addition, citizens should feel comfortable criticising, challenging or revising the framework 
proposed by dominant actors. That is of utmost importance considering the unconscious dynamics 
between experts and citizens reported by Felt et al. (2009) in their experimental bottom–up engage-
ment on the ethics of genomics. They observed that experts tend to mobilise facts to close the ethi-
cal issues raised by laypeople or reorient the debate to make ethically based doubts illegitimate in 
favour of science. The traditional hierarchy between facts and values makes it hard for citizens to 
question the arguments of experts, even when those arguments are more value-based than factually 
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grounded and when both parties are on an equal footing in the engagement process. The authority 
of experts is also reinforced by the willingness of participants to avoid disagreements that could 
damage the social context of the engagement (Felt et al., 2009). On the contrary, practitioners 
should pinpoint tensions because these highlight conflicts of interest or values that must be openly 
discussed and addressed to avoid damaging trust. Public engagement should not aim at reaching a 
consensus, which might even be impossible in controversial topics impacting people differently, 
such as the ELSI of health technologies (Daudelin et al., 2011; Kamenova, 2023; World Health 
Organization, 2022). Disagreements may change the timeline of the engagement process, but it is 
worth the effort because outcomes will be more original, diverse, honest and representative 
(Murtagh et al., 2021). The empirical study of Felt et al. (2009) draws attention to persisting power 
inequalities even in bottom–up approaches and the consequent need to counterbalance them with a 
citizen-centred understanding of engagement.

Another lesson learned is to allow sufficient time for citizens to become relevant contributors to 
complex topics (Degeling et al., 2015; OCDE, 2020). Rigidity in the process, for instance, to meet 
short deadlines runs the risk of locking citizens into the experts’ thinking (Bell et al., 2018), leading 
to misunderstanding their perspectives and missing their added value. The SIENNA project illus-
trates this point perfectly. It aimed to explore European citizens’ opinions on the ELSI of disruptive 
technologies in three areas (genomics, human enhancement and AI-robotics). Despite the consider-
able funding allocated to engagement activities, these presented methodological weaknesses that 
limited the contribution of citizens from the outset. The first activity consisted of intensive phone 
surveys during which 1000 citizens individually answered more than 30 multiple-choice questions 
about disruptive technologies in 15 minutes. Participants covered each technology (genomics, 
enhancement and AI-robotics) in 5 minutes without being allowed to reflect beforehand or answer 
‘I don’t know’ as an alternative response (Hanson, 2020). The second activity consisted of a repli-
cable workshop in five Member States, where groups of 50 citizens were informed and discussed 
the three technologies in only 6 hours (2 hours per technology) (Kantar, 2019). Due to these meth-
odological weaknesses, the organisers themselves recognised that the contributions of citizens 
were not suitable for formulating policy recommendations, leading to a waste of money and disre-
spect for participants (Kantar, 2019).

Ideally, citizens should influence the process from its early start by framing the questions and 
issues with other stakeholders to guarantee effective collaboration and relevant outcomes (Council 
of Europe, 2019). Some methods are more prone than others to foster active and early participation 
of citizens. In the case of online surveys, preliminary short questionnaires could be sent to partici-
pants to investigate their needs and concerns, which would then influence the main questionnaire. 
This preparatory work could also be conducted through qualitative methods, such as focus groups 
or interviews, to complement the quantitative results. In the case of restricted budgets, small crea-
tive solutions are worth implementing to enhance participants’ contribution to the topic. In the case 
of closed questionnaires, a white box could be added next to each question to let participants share 
additional thoughts, such as the relevance of the question in light of their needs and concerns, other 
priorities to investigate or their lived experience on these issues.

Deliberative offline methods offer more flexibility than surveys to empower participants. When 
given enough time to reflect and deliberate, people tend to focus less on personal interests to evolve 
towards considerations for the common good (Árnason, 2022), which is of primary importance in 
discussions on ethical and societal issues of health technologies. Furthermore, facilitators have the 
appropriate skills to guide citizens through collaborative processes. Their skills must combine 
attentive listening, effective and open-minded communication, creativity and keeping participants 
focused on the topic while exploring new ideas and unforeseen trajectories. The Belgian citizen 
forum on genomic information organised at the request of the Ministry of Public Health is a case 
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in point (King Baudouin Foundation and Sciensano, 2019). By considering citizens as equal part-
ners and with the help of facilitators, organisers realised that the way participants considered the 
human genome greatly influenced what they expected from genomics, which data uses they sup-
ported or opposed and under which conditions. Deepening their conceptions of the genome instead 
of focusing on what genomics is from a scientific perspective gave new insights into their recom-
mendations about how society should use genomic information in and outside healthcare (Mayeur 
and Van Hoof, 2021). Finally, the formulation of outcomes should be collaborative whenever pos-
sible. For instance, in the Belgian citizen forum, citizens presented the recommendations, which 
they had collaboratively produced with the organisation team, orally to the Minister of Public 
Health. They also contributed to the final report by reviewing it during a closing meeting preceding 
its dissemination (King Baudouin Foundation and Sciensano, 2019). Empirical studies revealed a 
strong link between the design of the process (regular feedback, unlimited space for solutions, 
tools to improve decision-making and control) and participants’ feelings of empowerment and 
satisfaction with the process and its outcomes (Brandsen et al., 2018). Improving participants’ 
skills as co-producers boosts their self-confidence in the process, their trust in organisers and 
authorities, and their willingness to participate in the project and democracy more generally 
(Brandsen et al., 2018).

Respect for outcomes

Engagement initiatives are repeatedly criticised for not leading to measurable impact (Kamenova, 
2023; Margaux et al., 2022; Pytlik Zillig and Tomkins, 2011; Ryan and Smith, 2014). It may gener-
ate anger and frustration among participants and diminish their sense of empowerment and trust in 
experts or policymakers (World Health Organization, 2024). For some, disillusion could be worse 
than not being able to participate (Brandsen et al., 2018). On the side of experts, it reinforces their 
scepticism about engagement being worth it (Bell et al., 2018; Das et al., 2022), creating a vicious 
circle of demotivation and disinterest from which we must escape. Promoting initiatives that have 
had a measurable impact is the first step to breaking that circle. The Guide to Public Debate on 
Human Rights and Biomedicine (Council of Europe, 2019) and a vast literature review of public 
engagement in health (Serio, 2018) listed a few initiatives that directly influenced policy, research 
and the health sector. One lesson learned from those initiatives is the official commitment of 
authorities to transparently report how they considered the outcomes (or why not), whether in the 
form of concrete actions, decision-making or broader conclusions that will feed further discussions 
(Baumann et al., 2022; Cambon-Thomsen, 2022; Council of Europe, 2019; Margaux et al., 2022; 
Nature, 2004; OCDE, 2020; World Health Organization, 2024),).

Nonetheless, feedback on impact is far from being a well-integrated standard. A systematic 
review of deliberative methods in health showed that only 2 initiatives out of the 28 allowed par-
ticipants to receive follow-up from policymakers about their consideration of results (Degeling 
et al., 2015). Authentic collaborations do not end when citizens go home: follow-up on the use of 
outcomes is crucial to perpetuating the value of public engagement in society. Respecting partici-
pants who offered their time and energy, usually for free, implies showing them the impact of their 
contribution (Blasimme, 2019; Brandsen et al., 2018 Daudelin et al., 2011; Kreeftenberg et al., 
2024; Middleton et al., 2023; OCDE, 2020; Saunders, 2018; UCL Public Engagement Unit, 2022; 
World Health Organization, 2024). Focus group studies on participants’ experience in public 
engagement revealed that they felt used when they could not see the influence of their contribution 
on the outcomes (Abelson et al., 2004; Litva et al., 2002). The acceptability of the decision-making 
process partly depends on the accountability to demonstrate how participants made a difference by 
being involved (Litva et al., 2002). However, the successful implementation of outcomes does not 
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solely rely on the goodwill of policymakers. The electoral system may create a gap between the 
long-term timetable required for implementation and the short-term political agenda. Sometimes, 
policymakers cannot implement outcomes because they lose the election shortly after the citizen 
consultation. A timely start to the collaboration with citizens is therefore critical.

Finally, the interpretation and dissemination of outcomes should perpetuate the citizen-centred 
approach. Interpretation of data must remain as neutral and transparent as possible, given that 
practitioners could alienate the contribution of citizens by manipulating data in their interests, as 
Blacker et al. (2021) pinpointed in several projects under the term public relations. Too often, prac-
titioners do not report results adequately, leaving external audiences unable to evaluate the quality 
of the activity and how conclusions emerged from the data (Middleton et al., 2023; Pezzullo et al., 
2021). Inviting independent experts to assess the quality of the process can be a way forward. To 
be citizen-centred, this evaluation must include participants’ appreciation, for instance, through 
interviews or questionnaires (Council of Europe, 2019; OCDE, 2020; World Health Organization, 
2024). The report of the KU Leuven that assessed the Belgian citizen forum on genomic informa-
tion usage provides an example of how to do so (Marien and Felicetti, 2019). Besides improving 
the ethics of public engagement, the citizen-centred approach offers professionals the opportunity 
to improve their work through constructive review in a mutual learning mindset.

5. Broader implications of citizen-centred engagement

Despite some progress – from ‘public understanding of science’ to ‘public engagement with science’ 
(Hu, 2024) – there is still a long way to go before powerful actors acknowledge the need to grant 
citizens an active role in the engagement process and the governance of societal issues of health 
technologies. Even if citizens’ voices are arguably as legitimate as the voices of other stakeholders, 
change in mentality takes time. Experts enjoy a dominant position because society relies on them 
as the default strategy when approaching a challenging issue in health technologies. It is more 
straightforward and comfortable to defer to the judgment of experts than trying to merge their 
insights with those of citizens impacted by the technologies. Part of the problem lies in the lack of 
willingness or honest intention to empower citizens because of the fear that they could hinder sci-
entific progress if they do not share the same values as the scientific community (Bell et al., 2018; 
Das et al., 2022). The current context and frame of engagement activities limit the zone of influ-
ence of citizens from the outset because they are expert-driven. Experts decide the engagement 
methods, the topic to discuss on which they already have extensive knowledge and well-formed 
opinions, the terms and definitions to deal with that topic, the information delivered to participants, 
and the interpretation and use of results. Wirz et al. (2020: 861) regret this elitist and unilateral 
approach to engagement:

This ‘engagement lite’ does not address the wickedness of the issue, is not accessible to many publics, and 
is not inclusive of non-scientific voices. Maybe most importantly, engagement lite is designed to ‘engage’ 
non-scientific participants, but remains without impact on the scientific community itself.

Hierarchy is deeply rooted in academic settings where power and knowledge are strongly inter-
related. The first step towards greater equality in public engagement activities is deconstructing the 
integrated hierarchy between scientific expertise and lay opinions in ethical and societal debates on 
health technologies (Daudelin et al., 2011; Felt et al., 2009; Hu, 2024; Kamenova, 2023; Murtagh 
et al., 2021; Prainsack, 2014; Wynne, 2006). Experts and citizens have complementary knowledge, 
meaning that they need each other to ensure the responsible integration of science in society. That 
notion of reciprocal engagement is gaining traction among experts, who are excited about learning 
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from citizens and leaving behind the image of science as an ivory tower (Bauer, 2014; Boon et al., 
2022; Hu, 2024).

Yet, realising the full potential of citizen-centred engagement requires structural changes and, 
hence, combining efforts. The most decisive one is institutionalising public engagement to make 
it a continuous process instead of ad hoc events. Institutionalisation means including public 
engagement in the structure, process design, and culture of research projects and policymaking 
(Boon et al., 2022; Council of Europe, 2019; Dryzek et al., 2020; OCDE, 2020; Pezzullo et al., 
2021; World Health Organization, 2022). Following a lifecycle approach, citizens should be 
engaged from the agenda-setting to the implementation phase of health technologies, not when 
problems have already engendered mistrust (Middleton et al., 2023; Ocloo et al., 2021; Wirz 
et al., 2020). Professionals could use different engagement methods for each phase depending on 
their needs, budgets and time allocated (World Health Organization, 2022). In any case, engage-
ment should be a priority, or even an obligation, as some have argued (Pezzullo et al., 2021), in 
national governments’ plans and research grant proposals and evaluations. Complementary strate-
gies could be followed to develop a culture of public engagement among experts and policymak-
ers. Creating networks for professionals to share good practices, lessons learned and support tools 
would help the growing but scattered community of practitioners make public engagement more 
responsible based on shared ethics (Boon et al., 2022; Engage2020, 2015). Those networks could 
take many forms, such as an online European platform with subnetworks at national levels or 
annual face-to-face conferences and periodic events to strengthen collaborations. Existing net-
works should be sustained and promoted, such as Demo.Reset, Participedia and People Powered 
(World Health Organization, 2024). Professionals also called for European awards to promote 
excellent, ethically responsible and impacting engagement initiatives to boost positive competi-
tion between professionals (Boon et al., 2022; Engage2020, 2015). Moreover, high-quality train-
ing should be available for research and policymaking contexts and ideally start in educational 
settings (universities) or early-career pathways (Boon et al., 2022; Brandsen et al., 2018; Daudelin 
et al., 2011).

Last but not least, the institutionalised citizen-centred approach is hardly achievable without 
dedicated structural funding. As highlighted by Meagher and Lee (2016), funding specific to 
engagement should be the norm without taking it from ELSI or outreach budgets. It could help 
support the multidisciplinarity of larger scientific projects regularly funded by, for example, the 
European Commission. National funders could follow a similar route with a minimum percentage 
of total research budgets allotted to public engagement. Most importantly, funding bodies and 
public institutions should lead the way by involving citizens and patients in the writing of calls, 
research design and the evaluation of projects (Sharma et al., 2016; Sharma et al., 2017). In turn, 
standardising engagement mechanisms in research and policymaking processes would reduce the 
costs and burdens associated with individual initiatives ((OCDE, 2020; World Health Organization, 
2022), fostering quality over quantity.

6. Conclusion

Despite the lack of agreements on its definition and shared standards, public engagement in the 
ELSI of health technologies is a continuously expanding field. Its necessity and added value in 
bridging science and society in a trustworthy and ethical manner are no longer in question. Yet, the 
malleability of engagement practices enables powerful actors and practitioners to frame initiatives 
in favour of their ambitions and personal interests, sometimes at the cost of citizens’ empower-
ment. These misleading practices weaken the legitimacy of public engagement and abuse the trust 
and voluntariness of participants. It is time to reinforce public engagement in light of its intrinsic 
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value to fully realise its potential and deconstruct power imbalances in both the involvement pro-
cess and the governance of health technologies (Fox and Martschenko, 2023; Kamenova, 2023).

This article explores what all public engagement initiatives should have in common to be intrin-
sically valuable. Starting from the assumption that public engagement must primarily empower 
those who are engaged and not those who already have enough power to make their voice heard, 
we argue that the more citizens are put at the centre of the process, the more the engagement prac-
tice becomes valuable, regardless of the methods used. The citizen-centred approach can be defined 
as citizens’ empowerment by focusing on their perspectives (values, experiences, concerns, needs, 
expectations) and considering them as equal partners, as far as feasible, in the engagement process.

Transparency, flexibility, open-mindedness, trust in citizens, accountability and respect for out-
comes are some ethical principles suggested in this article to illustrate the citizen-centred approach. 
While these principles intend to be transversal enough to be broadly applicable in any engagement 
method, they are neither exhaustive nor self-sufficient. Some methods will always be less prone to 
be citizen-centred because of their constitutional attributes. For example, online surveys do not 
allow the same level of interaction as offline deliberative forums. Our intention is not to impose a 
one-size-fits-all model that would oversimplify public engagement’s complex reality. Therefore, 
the citizen-centred principles must be combined with existing methods-specific standards to evalu-
ate the quality of engagement projects in their real-world context. Nonetheless, practitioners should 
pay attention to limiting and ideally avoiding potential conflicts between the citizen-centred prin-
ciples and the expectations and needs of powerful actors initiating or funding the engagement 
activity. These conflicts should be transparently stated and managed as early as possible, for 
instance, in grant proposals. The fact that public engagement must primarily be about citizen-cen-
tredness does not mean it is less valuable for powerful actors. Quite the contrary, it is in their inter-
est to understand and stay connected to people using health technologies because their power 
ultimately depends on the support and trust of laypeople. While this article focuses on the general 
population as the targeted public in engagement initiatives, it is critical to acknowledge the exist-
ence of sub-groups with particular needs and interests (e.g. vulnerable groups). Future research 
could study the questions that mobilise various sub-groups and the topics that require engaging 
specific sub-groups.

The citizen-centred approach serves the worthwhile function of broadening the discussion 
towards shared ethics in the community of engagement practitioners and stakeholders. By disam-
biguating the concept of public engagement from an ethical perspective – what engagement should 
fundamentally be about, independently of the methods used – we tried to make sense of the chaotic 
diversity of engagement practices and encourage practitioners to focus on the essential. The funda-
mental reason citizens should be at the centre of the engagement process is self-evident: it is about 
citizen engagement.
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